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UNM News Minute #378 – April 12, 2007 
 
1. THE UNM BOARD of Regents recently approved a 5.4 percent increase in tuition and 
fees for resident undergraduate and graduate students for FY 2007-2008. This brings the 
undergraduate tuition and fee total to $4, 570.80, up from $4,335.60. Tuition accounts for 
3.8 percent of the increase, while 1.6 percent goes to a scheduled fee increase approved 
by regents in 2005. 
http://www.unm.edu/~market/cgi-bin/archives/001874.html#more 
 
2. THE OFFICE OF THE REGISTRAR has announced the Summer and Fall 2007 
Schedule of Classes are now available online at: http://schedule.unm.edu/. 
 
3. MARTHA A. BEDARD has been appointed dean of University Libraries, effective 
August 1, 2007.  Bedard is currently associate dean for Information and Collection 
Services at Texas A & M University Libraries, where she is responsible for collection 
development and serves as a Dean’s cabinet member creating strategic plans and 
establishing priorities for library services.  
http://www.unm.edu/~market/cgi-bin/archives/001883.html#more 
 
4. UNM NOW BOASTS an internationally recognized, award winning Model United 
Nations team. Fifteen members of the UNM World Affairs Delegation participated in the 
Harvard World Model United Nations conference in Geneva, Switzerland recently and 
returned with three awards for excellence in diplomacy. 
http://www.unm.edu/~market/cgi-bin/archives/001876.html#more 
 
5. THREE STUDENT-ATHLETES have been honored as the inaugural Lobo Club 
Student-Athlete of the Year -- George Carter (football), Terryn Granados (women's 
soccer) and Jen Hale (women's swimming). The announcement was made April 4 during 
the annual Lobo Club Membership Drive Kickoff.  
http://www.unm.edu/~market/cgi-bin/archives/001879.html#more 
 
6. A CHECK PRESENTED recently to John Russell, chair of the UNM School of 
Medicine Department of Surgery, will benefit surgical students even as it marks the end 
of an era for a local professional surgical organization. The check, for more than $16,000, 
was presented to Russell for use in the department’s Residents Teaching Fund. 
http://hscapp.unm.edu/calendar/output/index.cfm?fuseaction=main.release&EntryID=590
2 
 
7. THE UNM JONSON Gallery is now accepting nominations for the Paul Bartlett Re’ 
Peace Prize. The prize will be awarded to a UNM student, faculty, staff person or retiree 
who has demonstrated notable achievements in promoting world peace and 
understanding. http://www.unm.edu/~market/cgi-bin/archives/001885.html#more 
 
8. THE BIOLOGY DEPARTMENT will celebrate the scientific achievements of its 
students at the 16th annual research day, Friday, April 13, from 9 a.m. to 5:30 p.m. The 
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event, which will be held in biology’s Castetter and Northrop Halls, will also feature a 
keynote lecture given by Thomas Whitman, Northern Arizona University Regents’ 
Professor in the College of Engineering and Natural Sciences.  
http://www.unm.edu/~market/cgi-bin/archives/001878.html#more 
 
9. A RECOGNITION RECEPTION to honor winners of the spring 2007 Research and 
Creativity Conference will be held Friday, April 13, from 3-5 p.m. in the SUB Acoma 
Room. University College, Profound, Special Programs and UNM schools and colleges 
held the conference April 3 at UNM in a joint effort to promote undergraduate research. 
http://www.unm.edu/~market/cgi-bin/archives/001881.html#more 
  
10. THE ANDERSON SCHOOL of Management has announced Mickey Byrd will be 
the new manager of the Management Development Center (MDC). Prior to her current 
position, Byrd was the program manager for the Executive MBA and Professional MBA 
programs at the MDC. http://www.unm.edu/~market/cgi-bin/archives/001868.html#more 
 
11. THE UNM INTERNATIONAL Studies Institute and Center for Science, 
Technology, and Policy present “Regime Change: U.S. Strategy through the Prism of 
9/11,” with Robert S. Litwak of the Woodrow Wilson International Center for Scholars, 
Tuesday, April 24, 4 to 5:15 pm, Dane Smith Hall, rm. 126.  
http://www.unm.edu/~market/cgi-bin/archives/001884.html#more 
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